
On 14 February 2004, a panel of officers, directed by Major General Antonio Taguba, 
conducted the following interview. Major General Taguba was appointed as an 
Investigating Officer under the provisions of Army Regulation 15-6, by Lieutenant 
General David D. McKiernan, Commanding General of the Coalition Forces Land 
Component Command (CFLCC), to look into allegations of maltreatment of detainees, 
detainee escapes and accountability lapses, at Abu Ghraib, also known as the Baghdad 
Central Confinement Facility (BCCF). The panel also inquired into training, standards, 
employment, command policies, and internal policies, concerning the detainees held at 
Abu Ghraib prison. Finally, the panel looked into the command climate and the 
command and supervisory presence 

The following persons were present: 

COL 	 CFLCC — PMO, Interviewer 
LTC 	 705th MP Battalion, Interviewer 
CPT 	 2 	Engineer Group — SJA, Interviewer 
MAJ 	 800th MP Brigade, Interviewee 

The interview is summarized as follows: 

My name is MAJ Social Security Number, 	 I'm presently 
assigned to the 801Migade. I originally came fromillillitary Police 
Group out of Ashley, Pennsylvania. I'm probably going back to that unit, when the 11th 
MP Brigade stands up in Ashley, Pennsylvania. 

I was the Si for Detainee Ops at Camp Bucca, also the ICRC POC. I was responsible for 
Theater Reporting that went to CENTCOM, also the NDRC POC, which is the National 
Detainee Reporting Center Point of Contact. At Camp Bucca, I was responsible for the 
Family Visitation Program, and I was also responsible for the interpreters. We had 16. 
Other than that, I was responsible for Processing Operations, and tracking all the releases. 

I had a processing line. It varied at different phases, during the deployment. For the first 
3 months we worked 24/7, and we ran 2 lines. So, there were actually 6 different units. I 
was responsible for 4 different shifts. Each shift would consist of 6 people. I had an 
NCOIC on every shift and a technical representative on every shift. As we moved north, 
we scaled down. We went from 3 battalions at Bucca, down to 1 battalion at Bucca. As 
far as Theater Reporting, I had 2 people from 530th, up until the last month, that assisted 
me with Theater Reporting. After they left, I did it myself. As far as the NDRC, I 
basically did that all myself. 1 used to have assistance from one of the Spec 4s from the 
530th, until they went to the MEK. The ICRC I took care of that myself, and the Family 
Visitation. I initiated that all myself, and an interpreter helped me take care of that. 

BG Hill and BG Karpinski are significantly different. BG Hill is more of a listener. He's 
very approachable. He will listen to any type of problems you have, and gather all the 
facts in. and make a decision. He's a very good person to work for. BG Karpinski is the 
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opposite. She kind of has her mind made up, and doesn't listen to different courses of 
action, suggestions, or issues. 

We had several versions of ROE come out, of course, and then we had a policy that came 
out, regarding release procedures from CJTF 7. But, other than that, not a whole lot of 
policies and procedures, regarding detainee operations came out. Towards the end, they 
published more, as far as the proper way to transport detainees, as they were released, 
things like that. Making sure they were fed, making sure they had a way home, I was 
doing all that at Bucca, so it was more transparent to the Bucca operation, than Abu 
Ghraib. 

The policy explained the different classifications of detainees, and how they would be 
released. Basically, they are Major Criminal, Minor Criminal, or Security Detainee. For 
a minor criminal the Battalion Commander has the authority to release those detainees. 
Major criminals, have to go through a Criminal Release Board. I think there's a 
moratorium still out on that. And Security Detainees left through the Security Detainee 
Review Board. HVDs would go through ISJ. 

As far as detainees being released that shouldn't have been released, I'm not aware of 
any, other than the escapes, or mix ups in courts. Well, I remember, if this is the same 
person, that somebody called directly to the Battalion, and didn't go through the proper 
chain of command, and said to go ahead and release him. He was going to be released 
from the Security Detainee Review Board in a matter of 48 hours, but they went ahead 
and jumped the gun. There was another one released at Camp Bucca, by an Article 5 
Tribunal. It was a big mix up. 

Camp Bucca started out on a landfill. It was hot. There were massive sandstorms. There 
was no d-fac, no showers, no latrines, absolutely nothing there. Today, there are trailers, 
it's all graveled in, and there are showers, MWR, and an Internet café. It's significantly 
different, now. 

We really didn't see BG Karpinski at Camp Bucca. I can only remember her spending 
the night one time. That's when BG Hill was there. BG Hill actually lived there. But, 
for a while, Bucca was the only game in town. So, I'm sure he would have been splitting 
his time between Bucca and Abu, if he had Abu, then. We saw a lot of BG Hill. He was 
very visible. He was a familiar face. We just didn't see BG Karpinski, so it would be 
hard to comment on it. I've only had a couple of conversations with her. 

I reported the incident involving the 10 soldiers, who were escorting a busload of 44 
detainees from Talil to Bucca, and some of the detainees were roughed up pretty badly. 
One of the detainees came through my line with his nose smashed in, and blood running 
down his face. So, I asked him what happened, and he told me. One of the DOD 
interpreters witnessed the incident out in the field. They were kicking the detainees, and 
stepping on one of their necks. A couple required surgical procedures. Two other 
soldiers, from 2 different units, also reported this to me. So, I reported it to COL Ecke 
and BG Hill, and they initiated a 15-6 Investigation. This happened in May of last year. 
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I probably know of every incident. Another incident that happened, prior to this one, 
involved a Canadian detainee. He reported to me, directly, being punched in the stomach 

111 several times by the same soldier, MSG'''. I reported this to COL 	and 6 he 
initiated a CUD investigation, but it was the detainee's word against MSG 	word, 
so that didn't go anywhere. Then, one of our . uvenil s had a broken 	d r orted to 

is story, an sai he a a en. 

In my opinion MSG 111111had a good record, and nothing was proven. She had a lot of 
involvement with detainees, and detainees would make up stories, thinking they would be 
released, if they said someone had hurt them. We were careful to check them all out, and 
there was very little abuse at Camp Bucca. I saw every single detainee that left, and 
ninety percent of the detainees thanked me and thanked the guards for the good treatment 
at Bucca. That is no lie. So, I was proud of Bucca and the soldiers, particularly the 724th 
soldiers and the 530th soldiers. The detainees spoke highly of the 724th soldiers. For the 
most part, I think we were sensitive about the Geneva Convention, and making sure we 
followed all the Articles. 

The 800th didn't have training on the Geneva Convention, at Bucca, but I kind of 
monitored that. I had very close contact with the Red Cross. The Red Cross came to 
Camp Bucca every single day for 6 weeks straight. So, the guards must have asked me 
once a day, what this article meant or what that article meant. Sometimes, I would ask 
the Red Cross about what their interpretations of different things. The policy at Bucca 
was to treat everybody with dignity and respect. We weren't lax on discipline, but we 
tried to be fair. 

A couple of months after the incident, I had a birthday. Some friends of mine from the 
battalion invited me over for a drink, which I went and had one. I went back, and the 
individual I was sharing a tent with thought I reported her relationship with the Battalion 
Commander, which I hadn't. So, she proceeded to go to COLIM and tell him that she 
thought I had a drink. I told him the truth, and somehow it escalated, and I had to see 
General McKiernan. I accepted responsibility, and continued to do my job. I probably 
came out more focused after that. 

I was in the Gulf War, and I don't remember anything like the incidents I've seen in this 
Brigade . 

I think we've had it easy at Camp Bucca, compared to Abu. Abu is so spread out, they 
have more detainee movements, and the mortar attacks. So, I don't think it's fair for me 
to judge what's happening, there. Abu should be a 2-battalion operation. I don't know 
how I battalion can keep that straight. I've felt that from the get go. 

In general, I would say that every single person I've had interaction with, at the new 
Brigade, has been very professional, and they were very supportive. Of course, they're 
coming in fresh. They're not coming in to Indian Country. At Abu, things are 
progressing, and a lot of improvements have been made. 
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I know LTC 	I think he's extremely intelligent, and I think he truly cares 
about the soldiers, but I don't think he's had enough UR experience. The 220th has, 
hands down, the most difficult mission of any battalion in Theater, and, after the incident 
that happened at Bucca, I would put them in there with another battalion; it's just too 
overwhelming. They were pretty beaten down, by what happened. It caused a big riff. 
There are still some soldiers, today, that think those soldiers didn't do anything. 

We knew that BG Karpinski didn't seem to like him; every time she saw him, she pretty 
much beat him up. That was the word I got from his staff. So, we were all told that he 
was relieved and sent to Arian, where he kind of got a spring in his step. We were all 
happy, when he was re-instated. We thou t he hadn't gotten the proper support. I don't 
think he was oftiiirelieved. M 	 overed for him, during this break. 
Later, MAJ 	ecame his XO, which was a very positive step. I think he helped 
him out a lot. 

I've had battalions call me to say CID wants to hold detainees. If someone questions me, 
I would hold a detainee for an extra day. I would also call to double-check. There's MI 
and CID representation on the Security Detainee Review Board. So, there's no reason 
that anybody on CID or MI Hold should be released. 

I didn't have a good experience with BG Karpinski. The only conversation I had with 
her was very negative. I went to a brief to pitch detainee operations. I didn't want to go, 
because I was super busy, but I received 3 emails, saying I should go. I don't think she 
was happy that I came. She said, if she knew I was coming, she would have told me not 
to. We had a dress rehearsal, and she be-rated and demeaned me in a way I've never 

Ai* been demeaned in m 17 1/2 	an years as officer. She told me I shouldn't have done the 
brief, that M 	should have, which would have been fine with me, but he just 
wasn't involved wi 	etainees. She thought I was a poor officer, but later she said I 
should be a Battalion XO, which was inconsistent. She said I didn't present myself 
professionally enough, and she referenced the drinking incident. I don't think it was 
personal; she's done that to many, many officers. It's just her style, and maybe it's 
effective with some people, but it doesn't work with me, because that's not motivating to 
me. 

I think she saw my name a lot, when she first started, because after I turned in the abuse 
incident, that made my life kind of rough. There was a Congressional filed by MSG 

11111111brother-in-law, saying I failed to call QRF, when they shot a detainee, when 1 
was even there. There were a series of IG complaints. It was kind of rough on me, as 
well as MM 	and SGM 	after this happened. After the abuse incident, 
everyone was trying to deflect attention om their own situation. 

There's no point in taking anything to BG Karpinski, because you can't get a sentence 
out, without her giving you the answer, or saying no, or fix it. She's just not 
approachable. 
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As far as the abuse, I think there should be training for soldiers on the Geneva 
Convention, as it relates to the treatment of detainees, and I think there needs to be an 
avenue where these things can be reported, because it's not a popular thing to report. 

Initially, I don't think anybody believed the abuse happened. LTC 	told me he 
didn't believe it, and I had to say, "Sir, I'm sorry. I know. I was there. saw e 
detainee. -  These were docile detainees. I don't think this was the first time they done it. 
Then, there became 2 factions; some that did believe it and were ashamed because it was 
hurting the MP Corps, and some that said they didn't. I lost a lot of friends, but I would 
report it, again. 

I know the abuse occurred. I don't think any soldiers would make that up about an MP. I 
think the NCOs should have been more severely dealt with, because they lead soldiers 
down that path, and had them convinced that they were doing the right thing. 

We've had 3 deaths. Two were medical, and 1 was a shooting. We felt, if we had less 
than lethal, it might not have gotten to the point where someone was killed. But, we all 
think they did the right thing. CID cleared them. It was self-defense. 

I encouraged them to stop using the conex for segregating detainees. I threatened them 
with ICRC. Conexes were used, before we had an isolation area. We had to stop, 
because the weather was so hot, that they might cook in those. So, we set up a better 
area. A vacant building was secured, and individual cells were built inside. 

The MP's view of the detainees varied from battalion to battalion. The 724th they treated 
them all with dignity and respect. If they saw someone who was overzealous, or went to 
strike a detainee, they pulled them out. 530th the same thing; they were very 
professional. In general, they treated them like people. Whereas 310th weren't always 
1/R, so they're struggling a little. 

Finished with their discussion, the panel gave mmagia list of items, to be 
addressed, and brought back on a Sworn Statement. 
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On 15 February 2004, MAJ 411111110-  eturned, to provide a sworn statement, documents. 
and a follow-up interview. 

The interview is summarized as follows: 

There were three reports that I had to prepare every evening, that were due at 0200 to 
CJTF-7 and CENTCOM, and these reports were used in the SECDEF Briefs, in the 
briefings to General Sanchez, and to the 800 th  MP Brigade. The Sls from each detention 
facility would send me a feeder report to me that would start with their beginning 
strength. and categorize all the gains, which could include new captures, transfers in from 
another detention facility, transfers in from Iraqi Police, transfers back from the hospital, 
as well as losses, which could include release in place, paroles, deaths, escapes, transfers 
to another detention center, or transfers to another hospital with an ending number. The 
Si s would also supply their in-camp manifest, as well as their not in camp manifest. I 
would roll up all those numbers, and do reconciliation between the gains and the losses, 
and provide the total Theater count. I would also report Tribunals, the different 
nationalities we had, who was in the hospital, and then I would put down any significant 
issues there were. I would also break them down by category and location. 

There are no accountability issues at Camp Bucca, because we do a daily headcount, 
which ties to their in-camp manifest, which ties to the report. They had 100 percent 
accountability. There were problems, initially, after the transition from the Brits. We 
patched their database into ours, and they had quite a few escapes. So, we went through 
the reconciliation process, but after that, Camp Bucca has maintained 100 percent 
accountability. 

Abu didn't have enough people in their processing line. They had less people in their 
processing line than we had at Bucca, but they had three times the amount of detainees, 
and ten times the amount of movements. Because of the number of movements, at that 
place, you need one person to just log the movements in between the facilities. So, I 
requested a corporal, who worked with me at Bucca and was at Mosul, be tasked to the 
320 th  for the purpose of scrubbing their database. She worked 12 hours a day for 6 weeks 
straight, and they were able to get 100 percent accountability of their security detainees. 
When I left, they still had a ways to go to account for their criminals. They were still 
about 100 detainees off, maybe less. 

I was asked to go up and help. The COLIIII the Chief of the National Detainee 
Reporting Center, at the Pentagon, asked me to go up. The 320 th  asked me to go up, as 
well, but BG Karpinski asked that I stay at Bucca. I was never given a good reason. I 
did want to go up and help, but I was told that they would have to sink or swim. I don't 
think accountability was a priority, until COL 11111111 ■sent emails directly to BG Karpinski, 
saying we were not in compliance with AR 190-8, or the Articles of Geneva. At that 
time, I did go up for a couple of weeks, and help them put together a plan. 

As you know, we took over a tent full of bags of property with no identification from the 
Brits. In addition they burned a lot of the personal property and money of the detainees. 
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So, it was difficult, but what we did was go box by box, and re-inventoried every single 
piece of detainee property. Things we couldn't identify, we put as unclaimed, in case it 
was claimed at a later date. I was hoping Civil Affairs could come in and help. I had 
them put the property annotated in the DRS System. It took a long, long time, but there 
was no other way to do it. 1 got the finance section of the 724, and they split up into 2 
shifts and chipped in. They were also able to count over fifty five million Iraqi Dinar and 
exchange that. We made contact with a bank near the port, and we were able to get the 
money exchanged just at the deadline. Those soldiers worked hard and very long hours 
just to do that. The money that wasn't claimed, we set aside, because a lot of detainees 
will come back and make a claim. A lot of those claims weren't paid, because the SJA 
required documentation. Now, unfortunately, Iraqis don't have documentation. It's a 
paperless society, and a lot of times they have all their possessions on them. All the 
money they ever had is going to be on them in a little box that they're carrying. So, if 
they came, and said they had x amount of dinar, and they have a capture tag, we'll go 
ahead and satisfy their claim. If they don't have a capture tag, but have a creditable story, 
we will pay half of their claim. It's fairly subjective, but I had them write up an SOP, and 
that's the way it's done. It's not perfect, but it's come a long way. I should also say, that 
I had soldiers from the compound patrol teams volunteer to come in and help. 

I have received my report card, and it is significantly different from when BG Hill was 
I* my senior rater. BG Hill gave me a top block, andput me in for a Bronze Star. BG 

Karpinski gave me a middle block, and COL 	told me that she had put a couple of 
comments in there, that he had to personally as er three times to take out, or it would 
have been an un-referable OER, but they were taken out, and I'm sure it won't hurt me. 
Its kind of what I expected, because there's been no interaction, and I doubt she knows 
what I do, but I'm alright, and I'm satisfied with what I've been able to accomplish. 

The interview complete, MAJ 41111111110was dismissed. 
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